
Johnson HVACR & Foodservice Equipment
d/b/a Johnson Mechanical Service, Inc. / Shearer Electric

1820 Riverway Dr.
Pekin, IL 61554

Invoice 137299

JOHNSON* HVACR & FOODSERVICE EQUIPMENTPh: 309-346-3434 Fax: 309-346-1923

www.johnsonfoodsorvicc.com

Bill To: Ship To / Job Location:

Morton CUSD #709*
1050 South Fourth Ave
Suite 200

Morton, IL 61550

Morton Junior High School*
225 E Jackson

Morton. IL 61550

Please remit payment to: Johnson Mechanical Service, Inc., 1820 Riverv/ay Dr., Pekin, IL 61554

Invoice Date Terms Due Date Work Order Purchase Order Rep / Clerk

NET 30 1268434/28/2021 5/28/2021

QTY Description Date Technician Unit Price Amount
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We now accept checks by fax and email. Save postage and avoid mail delays.
Send a digital copy of your signed check to us and retain the original.

Fax to 309-346-1923 or email to jmoe@jmsinc.net



Johnson HVACR & Foodservice Equipment
d/b/a Johnson Mechanical Service, Inc. I Shearer Electric

1820 Riverway Or.
Pekin, IL 61554

Invoice 137299

~eiU9S2-

JOHNSON» HVACR ScFOODSeRVICEEQUIPMENTPh: 309-346-3434 Fax: 309-346-1923

www.johnsonfoodservice.com

Bill To; Ship To / Job Location:

Morton CUSD #709*
1050 South Fourth Ave
Suite 200
Morton, IL 61550

Morton Junior High School*
225 E Jackson
Morton. IL 61550

Please remit payment to: Johnson Mechanical Service, Inc., 1820 Riverway Dr., Pekin, IL 61554

Invoice Date Terms Due Date Work Order Purchase Order Rep / Clerk

NET 304/28/2021 1268435/28/2021

QTY Description Date Technician AmountUnit Price

Equipment ID: #6103 / Sticker ID: 16169, ICE MACHINE, Manitowoc Ice, Mod. #; IY-0304A, Ser. #: 1101255393
Labor

3.75 Labor

Miscellaneous

1.00 OTH111 Liquid Leak Detector

1.00 OTH105 Nitrogen
1.00 OTH103 Vacuum Oil

1.00 OTH101 Solder/Acetylene

1.00 Recovered Refrigerant as per EPA Guidlines

1.00 R-404A-REC Lbs. Refrigerant R-404A Reco*.

1.00 R-404A-RCL Lbs. Refrigerant R-404A Reciai

1.00 High PSI Cut out

1.00 FAn Cycling Switch

1.00 Misc. Supplies, Level 1

1.00 Truck Charge

3/10/2021 $420.00Dan McClary $112.00

3/10/2021

3/10/2021

3/10/2021

3/10/2021

3/10/2021

3/10/2021

3/10/2021

3/10/2021

3/10/2021

3/10/2021

3/10/2021

Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

$12.60

$35.70

$18.90

$59.85

$153.00

$0.00

$0.00

$124.52

$136.81

$6.04

$32.00

$12.60

$35.70

$18.90

$59.85

$153.00

$0.00

$0.00

$124.52

$136.81

$6.04

$32.00
Parts

1.00 Lb. Refrigerant-404A

[INV] Sporlan Catch-All Filter-Drier C-032-

3/10/2021

3/10/2021
Dan McClarv

Dan McClarv

$22.64

$42.62

$22.64

$42.621.00
Notes:

3/10/2021

TECH NOTES

DIAGNOSIS: Found faulty fan cycle control,
ACTION/REMEDY: Made trip for parts. Replaced fan cycle control, high PSI cut-out,
direr. Pressure tested unit. Evacuated refrigeration and recharged to factory
specifications. Observe ice drip at 14 minutes freeze, 140 harvest.
COMMENTS/RECOMMENDATIONS: Unit is functioning properly.



Zimmerman, Amy <amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org>

Re: [STAFF] Johnson Mechanical 137299 
1 message

Schuck, Rodney <rodney.schuck@mcusd709.org> Tue, May 11, 2021 at 1:08 PM
To: "Zimmerman, Amy" <amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org>

2540.323.5- Approved

On Tue, May 11, 2021 at 12:26 PM Zimmerman, Amy <amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org> wrote: 
Please review for approval - 2540.541.05 
 
       
Have an Amazing & Blessed day!  
Amy Zimmerman 
MCUSD Business Office Assistant / Accounts Payable
1050 S. Fourth Ave. Ste. 200 * Morton, IL 61550
PH: (309) 284-8070  Fax: (309) 266-6320 email:Amy.Zimmerman@MCUSD709.org
 
Some days you just have to create your own sunshine     
 

mailto:amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org
https://www.google.com/maps/search/1050+S.+Fourth+Ave.+Ste.+200+*%C2%A0+Morton,%0D%0AIL+61550+%0D%0A%0D%0A+PH:%0D%0A(309?entry=gmail&source=g

