
Johnson HVACR & Foodservice Equipment
d/b/a Johnson Mechanical Service, inc. I Shearer Electric

1820 Riverway Dr.
Pekin. IL 61554

Invoice 137401

JOHNSON” hVACR E. FOODStKVlCE EQUIPMENTPh: 309-346-3434 Fax: 309-346-1923

www.johnsonfoodservice.com

Bill To; Ship To / Job Location:

Morton CUSD #709’
1050 South Fourth Ave
Suite 200

Morton, IL 61550

Lettie Brown*
2550 N Morton Avenue

Morton, IL 61550

Please remit payment to: Johnson Mechanical Service, Inc., 1820 Riverway Dr., Pekin, IL 61554

Invoice Date Terms Due Date Work Order Rep / ClerkPurchase Order

NET 30 1270974/30/2021 5/30/2021

QTY Description Date Technician Unit Price Amount

Equipment ID: #8090 / Sticker ID: 15606. ICE MACHINE, Scotsman, Mod.#: CU1526SA-1, Ser. #: 14041320015034
Labor

$112.001.00 Labor

Miscellaneous

1.00 Truck Charge

3/25/2021 Chris Hawkins $112.00

$32.003/25/2021 Chris Hawkins $32.00
Notes;

3/25/2021

TECH NOTES -

DIAGNOSIS: Found evaporator flaking off nickel coating and needing replaced.
ACTION\REMEDY;

COMMENTS\RECOMMENDATIONS: Quote given to customer for repairs/replacement.
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Customer Signature Printed Name Dale

We now accept checks by fax and email. Save postage and avoid mail delays.
Send a digital copy of your signed check to us and retain the original.

Fax to 309-346-1923 or email to jmoe@jmsinc.net

Job Title



Zimmerman, Amy <amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org>

Re: [STAFF] Johnson Mechanical 137401 
1 message

Schuck, Rodney <rodney.schuck@mcusd709.org> Tue, May 11, 2021 at 1:07 PM
To: "Zimmerman, Amy" <amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org>

Approved.  

On Tue, May 11, 2021 at 12:26 PM Zimmerman, Amy <amy.zimmerman@mcusd709.org> wrote: 
  Please review for approval - 2540.323.01 
 
       
Have an Amazing & Blessed day!  
Amy Zimmerman 
MCUSD Business Office Assistant / Accounts Payable
1050 S. Fourth Ave. Ste. 200 * Morton, IL 61550
PH: (309) 284-8070  Fax: (309) 266-6320 email:Amy.Zimmerman@MCUSD709.org
 
Some days you just have to create your own sunshine     
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